
 2025 JANITORIAL SERVICES

PUBLIC WORKS DEPTS (4)

OCTOBER 9, 2024

DESCRIPTION

1
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC 

WORKS - 421 WATER ST.
     385.59     4,627.08   2,045.00   24,540.00   3,488.33   41,860.00   3,748.17   44,978.00   2,200.00   26,400.00 

2
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC 

WORKS - 521 WATER ST.
     480.56     5,766.72   1,100.00   13,200.00   1,196.00   14,352.00   1,256.33   15,076.00   3,200.00   38,400.00 

3
WASTEWATER TREATMENT 

PLANT - 2995 LANSING AVE.
 NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID   2,990.00   35,880.00   3,529.08   42,349.00   2,500.00   30,000.00 

WATER TREATMENT PLANT -  

740 E. MANSION ST.
  1,800.00   21,600.00 

5 EXTRA WORK HOURLY RATE          24.75          28.50          23.50  65.00+ 
 NOT 

COMPLETED 

TOTAL 

(LINES 

1-4)

  3,000.00 

JO CLEANING SERVICE    

370  9 MILE RD NE    

COMSTOCK PARK, MI   

49321

MONTHLY ANNUAL

                    59,340.00                   110,032.00 

A. WILLIAMS CLEANING                    

200 W. CLARK ST.   

JACKSON, MI 49203

MONTHLY 

                  130,800.00 

  21,191.00 

SCSI, INC.                         

7900 BELFORT PKWY       

STE 300         

JACKSONVILLE, FL      

MONTHLY ANNUAL

  36,000.00   17,940.00 

ANNUAL

                   123,594.00 

FACILITIES 360                 

2750 CARPENTER RD    

ANN ARBOR, MI 48108

MONTHLY ANNUAL

     565.25     6,783.00 

                     17,176.80 

THE CLEANER                     

PO BOX 501                  

CEDAR SPRINGS, MI  

49319

MONTHLY ANNUAL

  1,765.92 

ITEM NO

4   1,495.00 


